
CITY OF HOUSTON
HCD Purchasing Unit 3200

 PURCHASE ORDER

Mail Invoice to
COH HOUSING & COMMUNITY DEV

FINANCIAL SERVICES SEC, ACCT PAY

P.O. Box 1562

HOUSTON TX  77251-1562

Vendor Address
Vendor Address Number 151177
POSTLETHWAITE & NETTERVILLE APAC

11757 KATY FREEWAY SUITE 650

HOUSTON TX  77079

USA

Information
Purchase Order Number/Date 4500319037-0 / 02/21/2020

CoH Vendor Number 151177

Page 1 of 1  

Buyer's Name Clarence Moton 454

Buyer's Telephone Number 832-394-6212

Buyer's Fax Number

Buyer's E-mail Address clarence.moton@houstontx.gov

CONFIRM RECEIPT AND ACCEPTANCE OF PURCHASE ORDER
TO BUYER'S E-MAIL ADDRESS

PO NUMBER MUST APPEAR ON ALL PAYMENT AND
DELIVERY CORRESPONDENCE

Shipping Address HOUSING & COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT

PROCUREMENT SERVICES

2100 TRAVIS, 9TH FLOOR

HOUSTON TX  77002

USA

Terms of payment : Pay net 30 w/o deduction Currency   USD

Shipping Terms FOB(Free on board) /DESTINATION

Your person responsible: CAITLIN LACHER

Item Quantity UM Material # / Description Unit Cost Extended Cost

   10 1.00 AU 45,000.00 / AU 45,000.00 

91863 HOUSING CONSULTING

Staff Augmentation Consulting

Refer to Proposal from Postletwaite & Netterville to Provide Professional Services for the City of Houston,

Housing and Community Development Department.

Gross Price       45,000.00 USD    1 AU                1.000         45,000.00 

Expected value of unplanned services:       45,000.00 

Delivery Date:  12/31/2020

_________________
Total **** USD           45,000.00 

The Terms and Conditions specified on http://purchasing.houstontx.gov will apply.
I hereby certify a certificate of the necessity of this expenditure is on file in this
department.

I hereby certify that the expenditure for the above goods
has been duly authorized and appropriated and that
sufficient funds are available to liquidate same.

        Mayor                          Chief Procurement Officer                       Controller



From: Adams, Jerry - FIN
To: Shah, Ketan - FIN
Subject: FW: PR 10272170 - professional service
Date: Friday, February 21, 2020 8:24:06 AM
Attachments: Postlethwaite and Netterville Professional Services Justification Form.PDF

P & N Proposal.pdf

Approved
 

From: Shah, Ketan - FIN <Ketan.Shah@houstontx.gov> 
Sent: Thursday, February 20, 2020 11:00 AM
To: Adams, Jerry - FIN <Jerry.Adams@houstontx.gov>
Subject: FW: PR 10272170 - professional service
 
Jerry
 
As On today, FY20 Citywide non-contract spending w/o council action for Vendor #151177
POSTLETHWAITE & NETTERVILLE APAC: $0
 
Current Professional Service Justification requirement: NTE $45,000.00
 
For your review and approval please.
 
Ketan
 
 
 

From: Moton, Clarence - HCD <Clarence.Moton@houstontx.gov> 
Sent: Wednesday, February 19, 2020 2:18 PM
To: Shah, Ketan - FIN <Ketan.Shah@houstontx.gov>
Subject: RE: PR 10272170
 
Sorry,
 
$45,000
151177
 
Thank you,
Clarence Moton
832-394-6212
 

From: Shah, Ketan - FIN 
Sent: Wednesday, February 19, 2020 1:35 PM
To: Moton, Clarence - HCD <Clarence.Moton@houstontx.gov>
Subject: FW: PR 10272170
 

mailto:Jerry.Adams@houstontx.gov
mailto:Ketan.Shah@houstontx.gov
mailto:Clarence.Moton@houstontx.gov
mailto:Ketan.Shah@houstontx.gov
mailto:Clarence.Moton@houstontx.gov



City of Houston 
Finance-Strategic Procurement Division 


Professional Services Justification 


General Information Date: 02/10/2020 


Department: HCD Phone No. 832-394-6228 


Contact Name: Ellen Eudy Email Ellen.Eudy@houstontx.gov  


Vendor Information Requisition No. 


Name: Postlethwaite & Netterville Purchase Order No. 


Address: 
11757 Katy Freeway, Ste 650 
Houston, TX 77079 


Contract No. 


Description. Please provide a description of the goods or services required, the duration or frequency of the 
requirement, and where will the services or goods be delivered. Please also identifi the annual cost of this good 
or service. 
Vendor is being procured to provide staff augmentation to the HCDD Finance staff, specifically with assistance 
working with the disaster recovery programs. The vendor has been asked to provide assistance with the 
following: 


• Implementation of a quality assurance/quality control process for program-related invoices and support 
to ensure reimbursement requests submitted to the GLO are complete and accurate prior to payment 


• Documentation of processes and procedures performed by the HCDD Finance team that will be used 
during external monitoring visits 


• Assistance with implementation of an electronic approval process of invoices (Docusign®) 


Explanation: Why is this product or service the only one that would satisfy the requirement(s)?  
The P&N team previously worked with HCDD Finance as a subcontractor with a former vendor. The team of 
professionals from P&N were able to quickly adapt to HCDD's processes and offer improvements and 
efficiencies without compromising compliance. The P&N team displayed working knowledge of regulations, and 
audit! compliance requirements of requests submitted, and even worked with HCDD Finance to provide the 
GLO's compliance monitors with requested information. 


Due Diligence. Describe the due diligence performed that led to the conclusion that this service provider 
offers the best value to the city.  
The HCDD Finance team has worked with the P&N team for over 1.5 years as a subcontractor for a former 
vendor. The P&N team quickly adapted to HCDD's processes and provided quality services during their previous 
engagement. The P&N team had knowledge of the audit closeout process and requirements, which helped to 
ensure requests submitted to HCDD Finance were complete and accurate prior to submittal. The P&N team also 
worked with other HCDD depai tments to ensure the requests were accurate and complete, which reduced the 
burden and workload for HCDD Finance. The P&N team also provided assistance with the GLO monitoring 
visits by providing process documentation and backup support to assist the monitors during their review. Because 
the P&N team was comprised of auditors, they were able to provide a first-level audit of the requests prior to 
submittal to HCDD Finance. The team also documented the processes and implemented efficiencies were 
possible to ensure that all requests followed the outlined processes. 


10/13/11 







City of Houston 
Finance-Strategic Procurement Division 


Department Recomme ion 
Requestor: ,' I..) Date: 4 
Department Director: / '('J ,kb )/ Date: . 


I' / 
Chief Procurement Officer's Approval 
Signature: Date: 


10/13/11 







Procurement Request Log - Staff Augmentation Service to HCDD Finance... Page 1 of 2 


PROCUREMENT REQUEST FORM 


Note: The Procurement Request form is to solicit quotes through on infor,eol (Srnoli Purvhose) b,d process for purchasing tronsoctions $100000 or less using Federal Foods (2 CFR 200.318) 


ond $3,000 to 49,0000 using non-Federolfunds (COHAP 5-8, Executive Order 1.14). 


Signature of this document is still required. 


Required Fields (must be completed] 


Description of Purchase 0 Staff Augmentation Service to HCDD Fl... HCDD Division: * Finance 


Deadline Date of 
Request: 


2/17/2020 Purchase Type: ° Service Under <50K 


Requester Name: • Blanton, Chunichi - HCD Created: 2/10/2020 


Requester Phone 
Number: 


832-394-6228 


grief Description of Scope of Work for Goods/Services: 


Vendor is being procured to provide staff augmentation to the -ICDD Flounce staff, specifically with assistance working with the disaster recovery progtams. 


Total Amount: $45,000.00 


Please see attached 


Note: Please allow a minimum of three (3) days for bid responses. 


FINANCE USE ONLY PROCURMENT USE ONLY 


Fund Number: 


Funding Source:
. _\ / f---  "I 


Cast Center: .3ocv 
GIL Account: :_6 / d 
Business Area: 


Internal Order: )Q 1OOQ7 7_ 
SF5': :.9L' 
Grant: '3 OC( 7 7 
Funds Reservation: 


Funds Approval Mgr: 


Justificotion of Need for Goods/Services 


C7 


Status: Pending 


Purchase Order No#: 


Name of Vendor: 


Date Processed: 


Dote Received: 


TotalAmount: 4/ 
Procurement Staff 


Priority: 


Notify Department: 


Notify Deportment: 


Procurement Notes: 


/ /c,- i? ho1) '7 .2/ 7 


r 
Requestors SiPnatur \),kj U)t 


Supervising Manager (Purchase under $5,000) 


ate: Date: 


Buyer's Signature: L:::;it; 
Funds Approval Signature: e2.7 
Date: / 1Zcib' Dote: 


Procurement DPU 
Signature' 


(Purchase over $5,000) 


Data I, /;2j,)7 
CFO Signature I 
Date: 


(Purcha. avi $5,000) 


Assistant or Deputy 


Director Signature (Only Con,j


,


ervices) 


Director or Designee: 
Date: Director: Date _— 


Attachments 


https ://houtx.sharepoint.comlsites/hcd/fp/pr/Lists/Procurement%20Request%20Log/ItemId... 2/10/2020 
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How much are you requesting for?
Do you have vendor number?
 
 

From: Moton, Clarence - HCD <Clarence.Moton@houstontx.gov> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 18, 2020 10:33 AM
To: Shah, Ketan - FIN <Ketan.Shah@houstontx.gov>; Rhone, Tywana - HCD
<Tywana.Rhone@houstontx.gov>
Subject: RE: PR 10272170
 
Ketan,
 
I have attached the Professional Justification Form and the Proposal for approval.
 
Thank you,
Clarence Moton
832-394-6212
 

From: Shah, Ketan - FIN 
Sent: Monday, February 17, 2020 9:15 AM
To: Moton, Clarence - HCD <Clarence.Moton@houstontx.gov>; Rhone, Tywana - HCD
<Tywana.Rhone@houstontx.gov>
Subject: PR 10272170
 
Clarence
 
Can you provide more information? Why did you assign to purchasing group S02?
 
 

Ketan Shah
Division Manager
 
Finance Department
Strategic Procurement Division
611 Walker St., Garden Level,
Houston TX 77002
 
Direct: 832.393.8714 Fax: 832.393.0499     
Email: Ketan.shah@houstontx.gov
 
Partnering to better serve Houston
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SAM Search Results
List of records matching your search for :

Search Term : POSTLETHWAITE & NETTERVILLE (A PROFESSIONAL ACCOUN*
Record Status: Active

No Search Results

February 21, 2020 11:21 AM https://www.sam.gov Page 1 of 1
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